
Terms & Conditions 

 

Welcome to www.salonindustries.com! 

These terms and conditions outline the rules and regulations for the use of The Company's Website, 
located at www.salonindustries.com. 

By accessing this website we assume you accept these terms and conditions. Do not continue to 
use www.salonindustries.com if you do not agree to take all of the terms and conditions stated on 
this page. 

The following terminology applies to these Terms and Conditions, Privacy Statement and Disclaimer 
Notice and all Agreements: "Client", "You" and "Your" refers to you, the person log on this website 
and compliant to the Company's terms and conditions. "The Company", "Ourselves", "We", "Our" 
and "Us", refers to our Company. "Party", "Parties", or "Us", refers to both the Client and ourselves. 
All terms refer to the offer, acceptance and consideration of payment necessary to undertake the 
process of our assistance to the Client in the most appropriate manner for the express purpose of 
meeting the Client's needs in respect of provision of the Company's stated services, in accordance 
with and subject to, prevailing law of ca. Any use of the above terminology or other words in the 
singular, plural, capitalization and/or he/she or they, are taken as interchangeable and therefore as 
referring to same. 

Cookies 

We employ the use of cookies. By accessing www.salonindustries.com, you agreed to use cookies 
in agreement with The Company's Privacy Policy. 

Most interactive websites use cookies to let us retrieve the user's details for each visit. Cookies are 
used by our website to enable the functionality of certain areas to make it easier for people visiting 
our website. Some of our affiliate/advertising partners may also use cookies. 

License 

Unless otherwise stated, The Company and/or its licensors own the intellectual property rights for all 
material on www.salonindustries.com. All intellectual property rights are reserved. You may access 
this from www.salonindustries.com for your own personal use subjected to restrictions set in these 
terms and conditions. 

You must not: 

• Republish material from www.salonindustries.com 
• Sell, rent or sub-license material from www.salonindustries.com 
• Reproduce, duplicate or copy material from www.salonindustries.com 
• Redistribute content from www.salonindustries.com 

Hyperlinking to our Content 



The following organizations may link to our Website without prior written approval: 

• Government agencies; 
• Search engines; 
• News organizations; 
• Online directory distributors may link to our Website in the same manner as they hyperlink to 

the Websites of other listed businesses; and 
• System wide Accredited Businesses except soliciting non-profit organizations, charity 

shopping malls, and charity fundraising groups which may not hyperlink to our Web site. 

These organizations may link to our home page, to publications or to other Website information so 
long as the link: (a) is not in any way deceptive; (b) does not falsely imply sponsorship, endorsement 
or approval of the linking party and its products and/or services; and (c) fits within the context of the 
linking party's site. 

We may consider and approve other link requests from the following types of organizations: 

• commonly-known consumer and/or business information sources; 
• dot.com community sites; 
• associations or other groups representing charities; 
• online directory distributors; 
• internet portals; 
• accounting, law and consulting firms; and 
• educational institutions and trade associations. 

We will approve link requests from these organizations if we decide that: (a) the link would not make 
us look unfavorably to ourselves or to our accredited businesses; (b) the organization does not have 
any negative records with us; (c) the benefit to us from the visibility of the hyperlink compensates the 
absence of The Company; and (d) the link is in the context of general resource information. 

These organizations may link to our home page so long as the link: (a) is not in any way deceptive; 
(b) does not falsely imply sponsorship, endorsement or approval of the linking party and its products 
or services; and (c) fits within the context of the linking party's site. 

If you are one of the organizations listed in paragraph 2 above and are interested in linking to our 
website, you must inform us by sending an e-mail to The Company. Please include your name, your 
organization name, contact information as well as the URL of your site, a list of any URLs from which 
you intend to link to our Website, and a list of the URLs on our site to which you would like to link. 
Wait 2-3 weeks for a response. 

Approved organizations may hyperlink to our Website as follows: 

• By use of our corporate name; or 
• By use of the uniform resource locator being linked to; or 
• By use of any other description of our Website being linked to that makes sense within the 

context and format of content on the linking party's site. 

No use of The Company's logo or other artwork will be allowed for linking absent a trademark license 
agreement. 



iFrames 

Without prior approval and written permission, you may not create frames around our Webpages 
that alter in any way the visual presentation or appearance of our Website. 

Content Liability 

We shall not be hold responsible for any content that appears on your Website. You agree to protect 
and defend us against all claims that is rising on your Website. No link(s) should appear on any 
Website that may be interpreted as libelous, obscene or criminal, or which infringes, otherwise 
violates, or advocates the infringement or other violation of, any third party rights. 

Reservation of Rights 

We reserve the right to request that you remove all links or any particular link to our Website. You 
approve to immediately remove all links to our Website upon request. We also reserve the right to 
amen these terms and conditions and it's linking policy at any time. By continuously linking to our 
Website, you agree to be bound to and follow these linking terms and conditions. 

Removal of links from our website 

If you find any link on our Website that is offensive for any reason, you are free to contact and inform 
us any moment. We will consider requests to remove links but we are not obligated to or so or to 
respond to you directly. 

We do not ensure that the information on this website is correct, we do not warrant its completeness 
or accuracy; nor do we promise to ensure that the website remains available or that the material on 
the website is kept up to date. 

Disclaimer 

To the maximum extent permitted by applicable law, we exclude all representations, warranties and 
conditions relating to our website and the use of this website. Nothing in this disclaimer will: 

• limit or exclude our or your liability for death or personal injury; 
• limit or exclude our or your liability for fraud or fraudulent misrepresentation; 
• limit any of our or your liabilities in any way that is not permitted under applicable law; or 
• exclude any of our or your liabilities that may not be excluded under applicable law. 

The limitations and prohibitions of liability set in this Section and elsewhere in this disclaimer: (a) are 
subject to the preceding paragraph; and (b) govern all liabilities arising under the disclaimer, 
including liabilities arising in contract, in tort and for breach of statutory duty. 

As long as the website and the information and services on the website are provided free of charge, 
we will not be liable for any loss or damage of any nature. 

 

 



Payments 

All or a portion of the services offered by The Company on the website are paid in accordance with 
the terms below: 

a.) Forms of Payment. We accept payment through the methods offered at the time of purchase or 
when a balance is due. The provider and method of payment are determined by your location, 
device, and purchased item. We reserve the right, at any time, to reject payment for any reason. 

b.) Currency. Payments will be accepted on the website in the currency based on your location and 
in accordance with local laws. 

c.) Refund Policy. Except when required by law, payments made by a user are not refundable by 
The Company. Refund requests are administered on a case-by-case basis and, if granted, do so at 
the sole discretion of The Company. 

Subscriptions. 

If any of the services offered by us are only available with a paid subscription, you will be billed in 
advance and on a recurring and periodic basis (such as daily, weekly, monthly, annually, or other 
agreed upon timeframes) at the end of each period. With each successful payment, the subscription 
will automatically renew under the same conditions unless canceled. 

a.) Cancellation. You are entitled to cancel a subscription at any time and in accordance with the 
terms of this Agreement. Cancellation does not entitle you to a refund for any prior payments made. 

b.) Fee Changes. If any changes occur to the subscription amount, you will be given notice of at 
least one (1) billing cycle prior to the change taking effect. Notice will be given by the e-mail on your 
registered account or profile. 

c.) Free Trials. Any free trial, sample, or other abridged versions of our services that are offered shall 
be considered a one (1) time use based on the registering of a user's e-mail and personal contact 
information. It is strictly prohibited for a user to create and register more than one (1) e-mail and 
personal contact information solely to access another free trial on the website. 

 

Access. 

Your access to and use of the website and the services is conditional upon your acceptance of and 
compliance with this Agreement, which applies to all the website's visitors. If for any reason, you do 
not agree with any of the terms of this Agreement, you may not access the website or its services. 
Additionally, your access to and use of the services is also conditional upon your acceptance of and 
compliance with our privacy policy which describes our policies and procedures on the collection, 
use, and disclosure of your personal information which is initiated by and commences when you use 
the website. The privacy policy discloses details and discloses your privacy rights and protections 
under applicable laws. It is advised to read our privacy policy prior to accessing the website or its 
services. 

 



a.) Minors (under the age of 18). 

If any user is a minor in the jurisdiction where they reside, the minor must obtain permission from 
their parent or guardian to use the website. If a minor accesses the website, it is assumed that their 
parent or guardian has read and agrees to this Agreement and has given permission to the minor to 
use the website. 

We do not claim that the website's content is appropriate or suitable for you or any visitor. No 
information, data, or information provided on the website is intended for distribution or use in any 
location where such usage is prohibited or is contrary to any law or regulation which would subject 
the Company to the legal liability of any type. Any such access or use of the website is to be utilized 
on your own initiative, and you are solely responsible for any legal compliance. 

Any supplemental amendments or documents posted on the website following the effective date of 
this Agreement are to be considered expressly incorporated into this Agreement. 

 

Prohibited activities. 

As a user of our services, whether on the website or mobile app, it is prohibited to engage in the 
following activities to: 

-Systematically retrieve data or other content from the website or services to create or compile, 
directly or indirectly, a collection, compilation, database, or directory without our written permission; -
Trick, defraud, or mislead other users or us, especially in any attempt to learn sensitive account 
information such as user passwords; 

-Circumvent, disable, or otherwise interfere with security-related features of the website or services, 
including those that restrict the copying of content or protected marks; 

-Disparage, tarnish, or otherwise harm the company, website, mobile app, or any other platforms 
where the services are offered; 

-Use any information obtained from the website or the service to harass, abuse, or harm another 
person or group of people; 

-Make improper use of our support services, specifically, our customer service representatives, or 
make false reports of abuse or misconduct; 

-Use the website or services in a manner that is inconsistent with its intended use or against any 
applicable laws; 

-Engage in spamming, linking, or referring to other websites for commercial or other purposes; -
Upload or transmit, or the attempt of such act, viruses, trojan horses, or other damaging or improper 
material, including the spamming or continuous posting of repetitive text, that has the potential to 
interfere, modify, impair, disrupt, alter, or interfere with another user's experience with the website or 
its features, functions, operations, or maintenance; 



-Attempting any unauthorized automated use of the website, such as using scripts to send 
comments and messages, or using mining tools with the intention of gathering, injecting, or 
extracting data; -Deleting copyrights, trademarks, disclaimers, or any other marks from the website 
or its content; -Impersonating another user or person by use of a username, e-mail, personal name, 
or in any othernmanner; 

-Upload or transmit, or the attempt of such act, any material that acts as a passive or active 
information collection or transmission mechanism, including without limitation, clear graphics 
interchange formats ("gifs"), 1x1 pixels, web bugs, cookies, or other similar devices, also known as 
"spyware," "passive collection mechanisms" or "pcms;" 

-Interfering with, disrupting, or creating an undue burden on the website, services, networks, and 
other connections; 

-Harassing, annoying, intimidating, or threatening any of the other users, employees, agents, 
contractors, or any other individual affiliated with the company; 

-Disabling or attempting to disable restrictions implemented by the website that prohibits access to 
certain areas; 

-Copying or adapting the software of the website, including but not limited to PHP, HTML, 
JavaScript, or other code; 

-Deciphering, decompiling, disassembling, or reverse engineering any of the software on the 
website; -Except as may be the result of standard search engine or internet browser usage, to use, 
launch, develop, or distribute any automated system, including without limitation, any crawl-able 
spider, robot or bots, cheat utility, scraper, or offline reader that accessed the website or services, or 
using or launching any unauthorized script or other software; 

-Using a buying or purchasing agent to make purchases on the website; 

 

-Making any unauthorized use of the website or the services, such as collecting usernames, e-mail 
addresses, or personal names of users by electronic or other means to send unsolicited e-mails or 
create user accounts by automated means or under false pretenses; 

-Using the website or services as part of any effort to compete with us or otherwise using the 
website, services, marks, content, data, or any part thereof for any revenue-generating endeavor, 
commercial purpose, or for personal benefit; 

-Using the website or services to advertise or offer to sell goods or other services; 

-Selling your user profile or account on the website. 
 

Guidelines for reviews. 

We may provide you, either on the website or by a 3rd party, the right to leave a review or rating of 
the services provided. Said review or rating requires that you: 

-Should have firsthand experience with the person/entity being reviewed; 



-Do not contain any offensive, abusive, racist, profanity-laden language; 

-Do not reference discriminatory language or references related to religion, race, gender, national 
origin, age, marital status, sexual orientation, or disability; 

-Do not include references to illegal activity; 

-Do not post negative reviews as part of a scheme working with a competitor of ours; 

-Do not make any suggestions or conclusions as to the legality of our services, products, or conduct; 
-Do not post any false or misleading comments about your experience with the website or our 
company; and 

-Do not organize a campaign encouraging others to post reviews, whether positive or negative. 

In our sole discretion, we may decide to accept, reject, or remove reviews. Our responsibility is to 
screen reviews to ensure that any postings regarding the website and its services are accurate and 
verifiable. Any reviews made by you or other users of the website do not represent our opinions or 
statements of the services or of our affiliates or partners. We do not assume liability, claims, or 
losses resulting from any review made on the website. By posting a review, you hereby grant us a 
perpetual, nonexclusive, worldwide, commercial, royalty-free, and assignable license (and 
sublicense ability) to reproduce, modify, translate, transmit by any means, display, perform, and/or 
distribute all content relating to such reviews made. 
 

Copyright policy. 

a.) Intellectual Property Infringement. 

It is our duty to respect the intellectual property rights of others. Therefore, it is our policy to respond 
to any claim that infringes on any trademark, copyright, or other intellectual property protected under 
law. 

If you are an owner of any protected intellectual property that you feel is being used without your 
authorization, you must submit notice to us by any of the contact details mentioned herein and 
include a detailed description of the alleged infringement. 

If any request is made, and it is determined that you are not the owner of the intellectual property or 
do not have the authority to act on the owner's behalf, you may be held accountable for damages 
which may also include costs related to attorneys' fees for such misrepresentation. 

 

Intellectual property. 

Except as otherwise indicated, all source coding, databases, functionalities, software, graphic 
designs, and media of any kind (e.g. audio, video, text, photos, etc.), content, trademarks, service 
marks, logos, and copyrights are considered to be intellectual and proprietary information 
(“intellectual property”). Such intellectual information is under our ownership and protected by local, 
state, national, and international laws and will be defended. 

No intellectual property is permitted to be copied, reproduced, aggregated, republished, uploaded, 
posted, publicly displayed, encoded, translated, transmitted, distributed, sold, licensed, or otherwise 
exploited for commercial purposes without our express prior written permission. 
 



 

User obligations. 

You, as a user of the website or any of its services, agree to the following: 

-Any information used for registration purposes, if required, must be submitted in an accurate and 
completed manner; 

-If any information should change regarding your account, you agree to change it in a timely fashion; 
-You have the legal capacity to understand, agree with, and comply with this Agreement; 

-That you are not considered a minor in the jurisdiction where you reside or are accessing the 
website or its services; 

-That you will not access the website or its services through the use of bots, scripts, or any other use 
than the traditional manner as is intended; and 

-That you will use the website and its services in an authorized and legal manner in accordance with 
this Agreement. 

In regard to any of the information submitted by you, if it should be deemed inaccurate, out of date, 
or incomplete, we reserve the right to terminate your access to the website or account and any 
future intended use. 

 

Third (3rd) party website and content. 

Our website or services may contain links to 3rd party websites or services that are not owned or 
controlled by us. Therefore, we assume no responsibility for the content, privacy policies, terms of 
use, practices, services, experiences, activities, or any other acts by 3rd parties. You acknowledge 
that if you are to be re-directed or forwarded to such 3rd party website, you hold us harmless and 
free of liability for any action that should occur on such websites, which may or may not include 
damages, losses, or any other claims. 

 

 

Site management. 

To ensure the best experience for all users of our website and services, we reserve the right, in our 
sole discretion, to do the following: 

-To monitor our website, services, and any other content for violations by users of this Agreement; -
To take appropriate actions against our users, including legal action, for those who may have 
violated this Agreement or have attempted to defraud or cause harm to other users; 

-To refuse, restrict, limit, disable, or remove any and all files and Content which, due to excessive 
size limits or other properties, are burdensome to our systems or other users; and 

-To otherwise manage our website and services in such a way as to protect our rights and property 
and to encourage the optimal running of said websites and services. 
 



Privacy policy. 

Your access to and use of our website or services is conditional upon your acceptance of our privacy 
policy. Our privacy policy describes our rules and procedures on the collection, use, and disclosure 
of your personal information and details your privacy rights and how the law protects you and such 
data. It is recommended for all users to read to know their rights. Our privacy policy can be found at 
the following URL: www.salonindustries.com/privacy-policy.php 

We maintain the right to store certain data that you have transmitted by the use of the website or any 
of our services. You are solely responsible for the data you transmit and how it relates to any activity 
you have undertaken when using the website and any of its services. Therefore, you agree that we 
have no liability to you for any loss, breach, or corruption of any data and hereby waive any right of 
action against us that may or may not arise from such loss, breach, or corruption. 

 

Termination. 

We may terminate or suspend your account for any reason and at our sole discretion. If your 
account is suspended or terminated, we may or may not provide prior notice. Upon termination, your 
access to the website and/or services will cease immediately. 

 

If you wish to terminate your relationship with us, such termination can be made by simply 
discontinuing your use of the website and its services. 

 

Governing law. 

The laws governing the company's jurisdiction mentioned herein shall govern this Agreement, 
including your use and access to the website and services. Your use of this website, services, and 
any mobile app may be subject to other local, state, province, national, and international laws. 

 

Dispute resolution. 

If you should raise any dispute about the website, its content, or any of the services offered, it is 
required first to attempt to resolve the dispute formally by contacting us. 

a.) Mediation. If a dispute cannot be agreed upon by the parties, it shall be moved to mediation for a 
period of 30 days with at least 10 hours to be committed by each party in accordance with the 
procedures of the Canada Arbitration & Mediation. All costs related to said mediation shall be shared 
equally by both parties. 

b.) Arbitration. If the dispute cannot be agreed upon during the mediation period, then the dispute 
will be submitted to binding arbitration in the jurisdiction of governing law. 

We maintain the right to bring proceedings regarding the substance of any dispute in the courts of 
the country where you or we reside. 

"As-is" disclaimer. 



It is recognized to you, as a user of the website and any services offered, that they are provided on 
an "as-is," "where is," and "as available" basis, including faults and defects without warranty. 

To the maximum extent permitted under applicable law, the company, on its own behalf and those of 
its affiliates, licensors, and service providers, expressly disclaim all warranties, whether express, 
implied, statutory, or otherwise, with respect to the said website and any services offered, including 
all implied warranties of merchantability, fitness for a particular purpose, title and non-infringement, 
and warranties that may arise out of the course of dealing, course of performance, usage or trade 
practice. Without limitation to the foregoing, we provide no warranty or undertaking, and make no 
representation of any kind, that the content or any services provided will meet your requirements, 
achieve any intended results, be compatible or work with any other software, applications, systems, 
devices, or services, including operating without interruption, or meet any performance or reliability 
standards or be error and bug-free from any defects that can or will be corrected. 

Without limiting the foregoing, neither we nor any of our providers make any representation or 
warranty of any kind, express or limited, in regard to the following: 

-The operation or availability of the website or any services, or the information content, and materials 
or products included herein; 

-The website or any services being uninterrupted or bug-free; 

-The accuracy, reliability, or currency of any information or content provided through the website or 
services 

-The website or any services, servers, content, or e-mails sent on behalf of our company is free of 
viruses, scripts, trojan horses, worms, malware, timebombs, or any other harmful code. 

Some jurisdictions do not allow the exclusion of certain types of warranties or limitations on the 
applicable statutory rights of a consumer. Therefore, some or all of the above exclusions and 
limitations may not apply to you. The exclusions and limitations outlined in this section will be applied 
to the greatest extent under applicable law. 

 

Indemnification. 

You agree to defend, indemnify, and hold us harmless, including any of our subsidiaries, agents, or 
affiliates and our respective officers, agents, partners, and employees, from and against any loss, 
damage, liability, claim, or demand, including reasonable attorneys' fees and expenses, made by 
any 3rd party due to or arising out of the following: 

-Our content; 

-Use of the website or any of our services; 

-Not able to use the website or any of our services; 

-Any breach of this Agreement; 

-Any beach of representations and warranties set forth in this Agreement; 

-Any violation of the rights of a 3rd party, including but not limited to intellectual property rights; and -
Any overt harmful act toward any other user of the website or its services. 



Notwithstanding the foregoing, we reserve the right, at your expense, to assume the exclusive 
defense and control of any matter for which you are required to indemnify us, and you agree to 
cooperate, at your expense, with our defense of such claims. We agree to use reasonable efforts to 
notify you of any such claim, action, or proceeding which is subject to this indemnification upon 
becoming aware of it. 

 

Notices. 

Except as explicitly stated otherwise, any notices sent to us must be sent to 

info@salonindustries.com. Any notices sent to you regarding any communication that must be sent 
in accordance with this Agreement will be sent to the e-mail registered to any account created on the 
website. 

 
Electronic means. 

When accessing the website or any of its services, sending e-mails, online forms, esignatures, or 
any type or kind of electronic records or communication, you consent that all agreements, notices, 
disclosures, and other communications we provide to you in such manner satisfies any legal 
requirement that such communication should be in writing. You hereby agree that the use of such 
electronic means will be regarded as sufficient and be viewed as the same as its physical 
counterpart. Furthermore, you hereby waive any rights or requirements under any statutes, 
regulations, rules, ordinances, or other laws in any jurisdiction which require an original signature or 
delivery or retention of non-electronic records. 

 

Miscellaneous. 

This Agreement and any policies or operating rules posted by us, on the website, or through any 
services or in respect to such constitute the entire Agreement and understanding between you, as a 
user, and us, as a company. Our failure to exercise or enforce any right or provision of this 
Agreement will not operate as a waiver of such right or provision. This Agreement operates to the 
fullest extent permissible by law in accordance with the jurisdiction where we are located and to the 
protections that you, as a user, are entitled to in your jurisdiction. We reserve the right to assign any 
or all of our liabilities, services, and obligations to another party at any time. We shall not be 
responsible or liable for any loss, damage, delay, or failure to act caused by an event beyond our 
reasonable control. 

If any provision, section, clause, or part of this Agreement is determined to be unlawful, void, or 
unenforceable, that said portion of this Agreement is determined to be severable and does not affect 
the validity and enforceability of any remaining language. 

It is understood that this Agreement does not create a joint venture, partnership, employment, or 
agency relationship between you and us, the website, or any of its services. You agree that this 
Agreement will not be construed against us by virtue of having drafted and published on the website 
for your review. Therefore, you agree to waive any and all defenses that may have been assumed 
under this Agreement and the lack of signing by any party hereto. 

If this Agreement has been translated, you agree that its original English text shall prevail in the case 
of a dispute. 
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